
Broken Arrow Municipal Authority

City of Broken Arrow

Meeting Agenda

City of Broken Arrow

Council Chambers

220 S 1st Street

Broken Arrow OK

74012

Chairperson Craig Thurmond

Vice Chair Richard Carter

Trustee Mike Lester

Trustee Johnnie Parks

Trustee Scott Eudey

Council ChambersTuesday, October 4, 2016

TIME: Immediately following the City Council Meeting which begins at 6:30 p.m.

1.  Call to Order

2.  Roll Call

3.  Consideration of Consent Agenda

Approval of Broken Arrow Municipal Authority Meeting Minutes of 

September 20, 2016

16-961A.

Sponsors: Broken Arrow City Council

09-20-16 Minutes - Broken Arrow Municipal AuthorityAttachments:

Approval of and authorization to amend the Professional Services 

Agreement with Gershman, Brickner & Bratton, Inc., to include 

consultation, benchmarking and rate modeling services for the Citizens 

Recycling Committee

16-1195B.

16.115 GBB agreement chg orderAttachments:

Approval of and authorization to execute a Regional Metropolitan Utility 

Authority (RMUA) Professional Consultant Agreement with CH2M Hill 

Engineers, Inc. for Haikey Creek Activated Sludge Management 

Rehabilitation

16-1200C.

160928 RMUA AE Contract CH2M Activated SludgeAttachments:

Approval of bids received and award the lowest responsible bid to Barco 

Pump for the purchase of one (1) diesel engine operated pump and hoses to 

be used for dewatering and cleaning operations at the Water Treatment Plant

16-1190D.

17.105 Centrifugal pump  bid tabAttachments:

Approval of bids received and award the lowest responsible bid to McNeilus 

Truck and Manufacturing for the purchase and installation of two (2) 

replacement refuse packers for the Sanitation Division

16-1178E.

17.110 Refuse Packer Bid tabAttachments:
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Approval of bids received and award the lowest responsible bid to Premier 

Truck Group for the purchase of two (2) replacement cab and chassis 

(Sanitation Trucks) for the Sanitation Division

16-1177F.

17.109 Refuse Chassis Bid tabAttachments:

Approval of the Broken Arrow Municipal Authority Claims List for October 

04, 2016

16-835G.

10-04-16 BAMA CLAttachments:

4.  Consideration of Items Removed from Consent Agenda

5.  Public Hearings, Appeals, Presentations, Recognitions, Awards - - NONE

6.  General Authority Business - - NONE

7.  Executive Session - - NONE

8.  Adjournment

NOTICE:

If you wish to speak at this evening’s meeting, please fill out a “Request to Speak” 

form.  The forms are available from the City Clerk’s table or at the entrance door. 

Please turn in your form prior to the start of the meeting. Topics are limited to items 

on the currently posted agenda, or relevant business.

All cell phones and pagers must be turned OFF or operated SILENTLY during 

meetings.

Exhibits, petitions, pictures, etc., shall be received and deposited in case files to be 

kept at the Broken Arrow City Hall. If you are a person with a disability and need 

some accommodation in order to participate in this meeting, please contact the City 

Clerk at 918-259-2400 Ext. 5418 to make arrangements.

POSTED this _____day of ___________________, __________, at __________ 

a.m./p.m.

____________________________________________

City Clerk
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City of Broken Arrow

Fact Sheet

File #: 16-961, Version: 1

Broken Arrow Municipal Authority
Meeting of:  October 4, 2016

To: Chairman and Authority Members
From: Office of the City Clerk
Title:

Approval of Broken Arrow Municipal Authority Meeting Minutes of September 20,
2016

Background: Minutes recorded for the Broken Arrow Municipal Authority meeting.

Cost: $0

Prepared By: Lisa Blackford, City Clerk

Reviewed By: Russell Gale, Assistant City Manager of Administration

Beth Anne Wilkening, City Attorney

Approved By: Michael L. Spurgeon, City Manager

Attachments: Broken Arrow Municipal Authority minutes of September 20, 2016

Recommendation: Approval of the minutes of September 20, 2016 for the Broken Arrow Municipal
Authority meeting
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City of Broken Arrow City Hall
220 S 1st Street

Minutes Broken Arrow OK

Broken Arrow Municipal Authority 74012

Chairman Craig Thurmond
Vice Chair Richard Carter

Trustee Mike Lester
Trustee Johnnie Parks

Trustee Scott Eudey

Tuesday, September 20, 2016 Council Chambers

1.  Call to Order
Chairman Craig Thurmond called the meeting to order at approximately 7:25 p.m.

2.  Roll Call
Present: 5 - Scott Eudey, Johnnie Parks, Mike Lester, Richard Carter, Craig Thurmond

3.  Consideration of Consent Agenda
Chairman Thurmond asked if there were any items to be removed from the Consent 
Agenda.  There being none, he asked for a motion.  

MOTION: A motion was made by Johnnie Parks, seconded by Scott Eudey. 
Move to approve the Consent Agenda as presented 
The motion carried by the following vote:

Aye: 5 - Scott Eudey, Johnnie Parks, Mike Lester, Richard Carter, Craig Thurmond

A. 16-958 Approval of Broken Arrow Municipal Authority Meeting Minutes of September 6, 
2016

B. 16-1142 Approval and authorization for price increase to previously approved purchase of 
three 2017 ¾ Ton Ford F-250 Crew Cab four-wheel drive pickup trucks for the 
Streets and Stormwater Department from Bob Hurley Ford pursuant to the State of 
Oklahoma vehicle contract 1000009355. Final cost amount per vehicle has been 
increased by $529.00

C. 16-1152 Approval of bids received and award of the most advantageous bid to Bob Hurley 
Ford for the purchase of two 2017 Ford F-650 service trucks for the Streets and 
Stormwater Department

D. 16-1153 Approval of bids received and award of the most advantageous bid to United Rentals 
for the purchase of a remote control Bomag Model BMP 8500 Trench Compactor for 
the Streets and Stormwater Department

E. 16-1148 Broken Arrow Municipal Authority’s Water Supply Report for the month of 
August 2016

F. 16-832 Approval of the Broken Arrow Municipal Authority Claims List for September 20, 
2016

4. Consideration of Items Removed from Consent Agenda
There were no items removed from the Consent Agenda.  No action was required or taken.
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5.  Public Hearings, Appeals, Presentations, Recognitions, Awards
There were no public hearings, appeals, presentations, recognitions, or awards.  

6.  General Authority Business
A. 16-1155 Consideration, discussion, and possible approval of Resolution Number 939; a 

resolution authorizing preparation and submission of a loan application to the 
Oklahoma Water Resources Board (“OWRB”) for financial assistance through the 
State Loan Program, with the loan proceeds being for the purpose of paying for costs 
related to design, construction, and inspection of water and sewer system 
improvements; approving the payment of an application fee; designating Legal and 
Financial Professionals to assist in the application process and approving contracts 
for such services; authorizing the Chairman and Secretary to execute certain 
application documents; and containing other provisions related thereto
Tom Cook told the Municipal Authority that the Resolution Number 939 regarded a request 
for authorization to submit a loan to the Oklahoma Water Resources Board (OWRB). He 
introduced Ben Oglesby of Municipal Finance Services, Inc. (MFS), who stated that he 
had passed around a two-page summary of what they were doing.  He had worked very 
closely with staff to identify municipal projects that were needed.  There were mainly water 
and sewer projects, which it was decided to break in two for bookkeeping and accounting 
purposes since some of the projects involved Haikey Creek, falling under the Regional 
Metropolitan Utility Authority (RMUA).  The various projects would be carried out 
relatively close in time together.  Mr. Oglesby stated that there was a companion Resolution 
to follow as item B, that was based upon what he was relating at present.  With reference 
to both Resolutions he stated that if Municipal Authority approved the Resolutions, his 
firm would apply to the OWRB to make a bond deal using the Board’s triple “A” credit to 
issue bonds, whereupon the Board would make a loan to the City to execute the projects.  
He anticipated that they would approach the OWRB for approval at its monthly meeting in 
November.  Upon approval of the application, the OWRB would tell the bond underwriter 
to go to market and they would be selling bonds by December.  However, Mr. Oglesby 
stated that he would come back to the Council one more time for final approval before the 
deal was finalized.  He would be working closely with the OWRB on the intricacies of 
financing, in association with Broken Arrow’s Finance Department and Department of 
Engineering/Construction.  

MOTION: A motion was made by Mike Lester, seconded by Richard Carter. 
Move to approve Resolution Number 939  
The motion carried by the following vote:

Aye: 5 - Scott Eudey, Johnnie Parks, Mike Lester, Richard Carter, Craig Thurmond

B. 16-1156 Consideration, discussion, and possible approval of Resolution Number 940; a 
resolution authorizing preparation and submission of a loan application to the 
Oklahoma Water Resources Board (“OWRB”) for financial assistance through the 
State Loan Program, with the loan proceeds being for the purpose of paying for costs 
related to design, construction, and inspection of improvements at the Haikey Creek 
Lift Station; approving the payment of an application fee; designating Legal and 
Financial Professionals to assist in the application process and approving contracts 
for such services; authorizing the Chairman and Secretary to execute certain 
application documents; and containing other provisions related thereto

MOTION: A motion was made by Johnnie Parks, seconded by Scott Eudey. 
Move to approve Resolution Number 940  
The motion carried by the following vote:

Aye: 5 - Scott Eudey, Johnnie Parks, Mike Lester, Richard Carter, Craig Thurmond
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7.  Executive Session
There was no Executive Session.  

8.  Adjournment
The meeting adjourned at approximately 7:29 p.m.

MOTION: A motion was made by Johnnie Parks, seconded by Scott Eudey. 
Move to adjourn 
The motion carried by the following vote:

Aye: 5 - Scott Eudey, Johnnie Parks, Mike Lester, Richard Carter, Craig Thurmond

Attest:

________________________ ____________________________
Chairman Secretary



City of Broken Arrow

Fact Sheet

File #: 16-1195, Version: 1

Broken Arrow Municipal Authority

Meeting of 10-4-2016

To: Chairman and Authority Members
From: General Services Department
Title:

Approval of and authorization to amend the Professional Services Agreement with
Gershman, Brickner & Bratton, Inc., to include consultation, benchmarking and
rate modeling services for the Citizens Recycling Committee

Background:

On January 19, 2016, The Broken Arrow Municipal Authority (BAMA) approved a professional services
agreement with Gershman, Brickner & Bratton, Inc., Solid Waste Management Consultants (GBB) to conduct
a Refuse and Recycling Survey.  That survey was presented to the City Council on August 16, 2016.

As a result of the survey, the City Council approved the City Manager’s recommendation to create an ad hoc
citizens committee to study the options available to implement a recycling program for single family homes.
The ad hoc committee is known as the Citizens Recycle Committee. The committee will consist of 10 - 15
residents who will meet and starting later this year begin to review the various options to create and implement
a curbside program.

To support this committee, staff recommends extending the professional services agreement with GBB to
provide support for the Citizen’s Recycle Committee. GBB has provided excellent service, a quality product in
the recent survey and has considerable experience in providing consulting services to committees such as ours.

Attached you will find GBB’s change order of the existing agreement of the survey to include:

· Recycling Committee consultation services-$33,000.00

· Benchmarking services for the committee-$12,350.00 (optional at request of committee)

· Rate modeling of committee’s plan-$22,700.00 (billed on a time-and-materials basis)

The total for all three services is $68,050.00.

Funds for cost of service and recycling analysis are budgeted for in the amount of $200,000.00 in this year’s
Sanitation budget under project number 16.5115.

Staff recommends approval of the change order to the Professional Services Agreement with GBB to provide
support for the Citizens Recycle Committee.

Cost: $33,000.00 to $68,050.00 (Based on services requested from the
                                                                            committee)
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File #: 16-1195, Version: 1

Prepared By: Lee Zirk-General Services Department

Reviewed By: Communications Department
                                    Finance Department

                        Legal Department
                        Assistant City Manager- Administration

Approved By: Michael L. Spurgeon-City Manager

Attachments: GBB Change order dated September 21, 2016

Recommendation:

Approve the amendment to Professional Services Agreement with Gershman, Brickner & Bratton, Inc. and
authorize its execution.
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City of Broken Arrow

Fact Sheet

File #: 16-1200, Version: 1

Broken Arrow Municipal Authority

Meeting of: 10-04-16

To: Chairman and Authority Members
From: Department of Engineering and Construction
Title:

Approval of and authorization to execute a Regional Metropolitan
Utility Authority (RMUA) Professional Consultant Agreement with
CH2M Hill Engineers, Inc. for Haikey Creek Activated Sludge
Management Rehabilitation

Background:

The Regional Metropolitan Utility Authority (RMUA) has selected CH2M Hill Engineers, Inc. (“CH2M”) to
perform design services for a new Aeration Basin at Haikey Creek Wastewater Treatment Plant (WWTP). The
project shall consist of conceptual, preliminary and final design services along with bidding services. The price
negotiated with CH2M is $1,407,664.61, of which BAMA is responsible for 50 percent. Award of the
agreement requires approval by BAMA. Tulsa Metropolitan Utility Authority (TMUA) will oversee the
agreement subject to BAMA’s input. Funding is available from a Clean Water State Revolving Fund
(CWSRF) loan thru Oklahoma Water Resources Board (OWRB). RMUA awarded this agreement on
September 28, 2016 at the RMUA quarterly board meeting subject to BAMAs approval.

Cost: $703,832.30 (BAMA’s Share)

Prepared By: Alex Mills, Director of Engineering and Construction

Reviewed By: Utilities Department

            Finance Department

           Assistant City Manager-Operations

           Legal Department

Approved By: Michael L. Spurgeon, City Manager

Attachments: Professional Consultant Agreement

Recommendation:

Approve Professional Consultant Agreement and authorize its execution.
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City of Broken Arrow

Fact Sheet

File #: 16-1190, Version: 1

Broken Arrow Municipal Authority

Meeting of: 10-04-16

To: Chairman and Authority Members
From: Department of Utilities
Title:

Approval of bids received and award the lowest responsible bid to
Barco Pump for the purchase of one (1) diesel engine operated
pump and hoses to be used for dewatering and cleaning operations
at the Water Treatment Plant

Background:

Water treatment plant staff currently rent a diesel pump unit and the suction and discharge hoses about six
times per year to dewater and clean the bank of plate settlers in the four pretreatment basins. The basins are
dewatered individually to enable plant staff to hose down and remove accumulated sediment and chemical
residual from the surface of the plate settlers.

The plate settlers need to be cleaned regularly to optimize the raw water floc settling and sludge removal from
the pretreatment basins. Keeping the plate settlers clean helps to minimize floc particles being carried over to
the membrane filtration units.

The fiscal year 2016-17 budget included capital funding in the amount of $60,000 to purchase a diesel engine
so that the rental fee would be eliminated.

The bid package was sent to 14 vendors for the supply of the pump and hoses. Seven bids were received.
Utilities staff has reviewed the bids received and identified the bid from Barco Pump at $48,081.45 as the
lowest responsible bid as it meets the specifications and is the lowest price among the six (6) bidders complying
with specifications.

Cost: $48,081.45

Prepared By: Anthony Daniel, Utilities Director

Reviewed By: Finance Department

                                    Legal Department

                                    Assistant City Manager-Operations

Approved By: Michael L. Spurgeon, City Manager

Attachments: Bid No. 17.105 tabulation
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File #: 16-1190, Version: 1

Recommendation:

Award the lowest responsible bid to Barco Pump for the purchase of one diesel engine operated pump

and hoses.
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Item United Rentals Barco Pump Global Pump
Whitestar 
Machinery

Edwards 
Equipment Blackhawk Pumps

Automatic 
Engineering

Specification

2007 Pioneer 
PP66S14L11BF6

1
2016 PrimeAire 
6NHTA-4045H

2016 John Deere 
6GHTAPIJT3T10F

Gorman Rupp 
PA6H60-
QSB4.5P

2016 Thompson 
8JSCE-DJDST-

45H-M

2016 Premier 
6NHTA-VP-
4045HF285

2016 Godwin 
CD150M

Priming assisted centrifugal pump 
w/trailer 12,000.00 34,797.00 36,800.00 39,350.00 49,921.00 43,000.00 53,239.00
Options

6"x20'  suction hose (5 ea.) 449.95 346.17 553.64 790.00 600.00 686.17 667.60
6"x 20' layflat hose (20 ea.) 831.53 577.68 742.50 650.00 165.00 1,030.56 1,163.65

Total $13,281.48 $35,720.85 $38,096.14 $40,790.00 $50,686.00 $44,716.73 $55,070.25

Total for quanties shown $30,880.50 $48,081.45 $54,418.20 $56,300.00 $56,221.00 $67,042.05 $79,850.00

Meet specs. No Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Delivery 4 days 42 days 28 days 77 days 56 days 84 days 35 days
Warranty n/a 2 yr 1 yr 1 yr 2 yr 1yr 2 yr
Bids were sent to 14 vendors

            Bid Opening Date 09-07-16

         Priming Assisted Centrifugal Pump
             Bid 17.105



City of Broken Arrow

Fact Sheet

File #: 16-1178, Version: 1

Broken Arrow Municipal Authority

Meeting of: 10-4-2016

To: Chairman and Authority Members
From: General Services Department
Title:

Approval of bids received and award the lowest responsible bid to McNeilus Truck
and Manufacturing for the purchase and installation of two (2) replacement refuse
packers for the Sanitation Division

Background:

The Sanitation Division of the General Services Department requested and sought bids for two (2) replacement
refuse packers. Funds have been appropriated and are available in the Broken Arrow Municipal Authority
(BAMA) Capital Outlay Fund in the amount of $381,000.00. The sum of $160,424.00 will be used to purchase
two chassis, bid separately, which will be drop shipped to refuse packer builder for packer installation and
delivery.

Bids were solicited from six dealers. Three submitted bids. The low bid is from J&R Equipment for a Leach
2RIII Packer. Past Leach packers have given us poor reliability and repair costs have been substantial.
Furthermore, the manufacturer does not provide for a rear tag axle to allow us to to meet state bridge laws
(maximm allowable weights on individual axles). McNeilus Truck Manafacturing is the lowest bid meeting our
specifications, including the tag axle feature. Their bid for a Model 2012 Packer is the most responsible and is
recommended for purchase. This packer has given BAMA staff outstanding service and reliability, including
low maintenance and low repair costs.

The total price for each McNeilus packer installed on the chassis, dropped shipped to their facility, is
$75,080.00. Additional options selected are reflected in the attached bid tabulation. Staff recommends award
of the bid to McNeilus Truck and Manufacturing.

Cost: $155,344.00

Prepared By: Lee Zirk General Services Department

Reviewed By: Finance Department

                        Legal Department

                        Assistant City Manager- Administration

Approved By: Michael L. Spurgeon- City Manager

Attachments: Bid tabulation on bid number 17.110

Recommendation:
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Award the lowest responsible bid to McNeilus Truck Manufacturing for the purchase and installation of two (2)
McNeilus Model 2012 packers.
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J & R Equipment McNeilus Trucking Waste Research

Specification Leach 2RIII Mcneilus 2012
New Way Cobra 

Magnum

Refuse Packer $69,447.00 $77,672.00 $86,356.65

Options:

Tag axle not available $0.00 not available

Work lights $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Hopper lights $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Hydraulic winch $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Back up camera $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Total each $69,447.00 $77,672.00 $86,356.65

Total (Quanity of Two) $138,894.00 $155,344.00 $172,713.30

Delivery 150 days 90 days 210 days

Warranty 1 yr 1 yr Not provided

Bids were sent to 6 vendors
History with Leach 
product is poor.  
Major breakdowns 
with body and 
hydraulic 
componants.  Tag 
axle not available

Excellent service 
record with this 
product.  No major 
problems or 
breakdowns.

Packer meets specs. 
but vendor stated that 
suspension was to 
light.               Rear 
tag axle not avaliable 
as an option to help 
with axle weight.

Bid 17.110
Refuse Packer

Bid Opening 09-14-16



City of Broken Arrow

Fact Sheet

File #: 16-1177, Version: 1

Broken Arrow Municipal Authority

Meeting of: 10-04-2016

To: Chairman and Authority Members
From: General Services Department
Title:

Approval of bids received and award the lowest responsible bid to Premier Truck
Group for the purchase of two (2) replacement cab and chassis (Sanitation Trucks)
for the Sanitation Division

Background:

The Sanitation Division of the General Services Department requested and sought bids for two (2) replacement
refuse trucks. Funds have been appropriated and are available in the Broken Arrow Municipal Authority
(BAMA) Capital Outlay Fund in the amount of $381,000.00.

Bids were solicited from six dealers, five submitted bids. The low bid was submitted by Premier Truck Group
for a 2017 Freightliner chassis in the amount of $80,212.00 each and is recommended for purchase. Additional
options selected are reflected in the attached bid tabulation.

The total price for two chassis is $160,424.00. The remaining funds will be required to purchase refuse packer
bodies, which were bid separately. Staff recommends that the Authority award the lowest responsible bid to
Premier Truck Group.

Cost: $160,424.00

Prepared By: Lee Zirk General Services Department

Reviewed By: Finance Department
                        Legal Department
                        Assistant City Manager- Administration

Approved By: Michael L. Spurgeon, City Manager

Attachments: Bid tabulation on bid number 17.109

Recommendation:

Award the lowest responsible bid to Premier Truck Group for the purchase of two (2) Freightliner M2-106
chassis.

City of Broken Arrow Printed on 9/30/2016Page 1 of 1

powered by Legistar™

http://www.legistar.com/


Premier Truck MHC Kenworth Summit Truck Rush Truck Bruckner Truck

Specification
2017 Freightliner M2-

106
2017 Kenworth T370 2017 Int. 7400 6x4 2017 Peterbilt 567 2017 Mack GU813

Cab & Chassis $79,665.00 $81,475.00 $80,943.34 $102,480.00 $126,780.00

Drop ship charges $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 one destination included

Other $1,440.00

Options:

Alternate 46,000 lb. rear suspension $547.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid

Total each $80,212.00 $81,475.00 $82,383.34 $102,480.00 $126,780.00

Total (Quanity of Two) $160,424.00 $162,950.00 $161,886.68 $204,960.00 $253,560.00

Meet specs Yes Yes No Yes No

Delivery 70 days 45 days 60 days 60 days 120 days

Warranty Basic 2 yr 1 yr 1 yr 1 yr/ 12K 1 yr/100K

Warranty Drivetrain 2 yr 2 yr 3 yr 3yr/unlimited 3 yr/350K

Warranty Engine 2 yr/250K 2 yr/250K 2 yr 2yr/250k 2yr/250k
Comments Service deptment not 

very good, repair work 
has been poor.  Vendor 
has assured me that this 
issue has been resolved.

Good product, Small cab 
for three workers

Plagued with with 
engine, electrical and 
service deptment 
problems.  Vehicles 
returned for incorrect 
repairs.  Poor in service 
time.  Does not meet 
specs in DEF tank 
capacity or with parts and 
service manuals 
(manuals require and 
additional fee of $1440

Excellent in service time 
from other Peterbilts we 
have.  No major 
problems. Small cab for 
three workers

Seating for 2 people only.                                
Tire size does not meet 
our specs.

Bids were sent to 6 vendors

Refuse Cab & Chassis

Bid Opening 09-14-16

Bid 17.109
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Fact Sheet

File #: 16-835, Version: 1
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