RFQ21.135
STORMWATER GROUNDS MAINTENANCE - NORTH

Bid Date 03/10/2021
Vendor JAND JBOWERS | LAWNSOF TULSA |  SOURCEONE | ™CPENIERPRISES
_ﬁ; " Materials Qty. Each Price Each Price Each Price Each Price
IN BASS PRO EXP. POND 1 $49.00 $397.00 $65.00 $112.00
2N BASS PRO NORTH POND 1 $60.00 $197.00 $59.00 $90.00
3N ELM AVE & ELM PL NORTH TO 51ST CENTER ISLAND 1 $25.00 $197.00 $44.00 $36.00
4N ELM AVE & ELM PL NORTH TO 51ST WALKING TRAIL EAST SIDE 1 $65.00 $294.00 $58.00 $105.00
5N ELM - TULSA RCAG NORTH TO DROP INLET 1 $12.00 $124.00 $44.00 $22.00
6N ELM & ALBANY SE CORNER 1 $15.00 $144.00 $30.00 $25.00
7N ELM & ALBANY SW CORNER 1 $22.00 $147.00 $35.00 $35.00
8N ELM STONE WOOD DR. SOUTH TO B.A. EXPRESSWAY WEST SIDE 1 $9.00 $114.00 $23.00 $18.00
9N ELM - CENTER ISLAND N OF HWY 51 1 $9.00 $97.00 $21.00 $16.00
10N ELM - NORMAN TO LANSING WEST SIDE ! $29.00 $147.00 $44.00 $36.00
1N ELM - PITTSBURG TO MEMPHIS WEST SIDE 1 $15.00 $147.00 $44.00 $23.00
12N ELM - WASHINGTON TO QUINCY EAST SIDE t $30.00 $294.00 $59.00 $40.00
13N ASPEN AND DETROIT CENTER ISLAND WEST SIDE OF ASPEN 1 $5.00 $49.00 $23.00 $7.00
ASPEN EAST SIDE - FROM: NORTH OF LOUISVILLE TO PROPERTY 1
14N LINE TO SOUTH OF OAKRIDGE TO PROPERTY LINE $45.00 $197.00 $58.00 $84.00
ASPEN - PITTSBURG TO TOLEDO. TOLEDO TO END OF PROPERTY 1
15N LINE EAST SIDE $50.00 $197.00 $59.00 $93.00
16N 9THN/S OF ELGIN EAST SIDE 1 $8.00 $147.00 $30.00 $15.00
17N 23RD - QUAIL HOLLOW TO SHELL STATION EAST SIDE 1 $18.00 $147.00 $23.00 $24.00
18N 23RD - RENO TO WICHITA WEST SIDE 1 $35.00 $197.00 $59.00 $67.00
19N 23RD - OAKLAND TO QUEENS EAST SIDE 1 $25.00 $197.00 $50.00 $38.00
MIDWAY RD EST SIDE - FROM: SOUTH OF LANSING TO PROPERTY 1
0N LINE TO: NORTH OF NORMAN TO PROPERTY LINE $30.00 No Bid $58.00 $38.00
21N ALBANY - 9TH TO 23RD ST CENTER ISLANDS 1 $5.00 No Bid $21.00 $7.00
2N ALBANY - ELM TO 9TH ST CENTER ISLANDS 1 $55.00 $297.00 $96.00 $80.00
23N ALBANY & OLIVE SW CORNER 1 $17.00 $147.00 $44.00 $24.00
KENOSHA NORTH SIDE FROM 27TH WEST TO PROPERTY LINE TO 1
UN 37TH & ON 37TH WEST SIDE NORTH OF INTERSECTION $90.00 $297.00 $36.00 $175.00
KENOSHA - 20TH TO HWY 51 NORTH SIDE & WHATABURGER TO 1
25N CLINIC SOUTH SIDE $30.00 $197.00 $50.00 $37.00
26N KENOSHA / 9TH - FARM CREDIT SERVICES TO FLIGHT SAFETY 1 $165.00 No Bid $74.00 $300.00
27N KENOSHA - 6TH TO WALGREENS ! $5.00 $97.00 $21.00 $7.00
28N KENOSHA - 4TH TO STH NORTH SIDE 1 $10.00 $97.00 $21.00 $20.00
9N KENOSHA - MAIN TO KENWOOD NORTH SIDE 1 $10.00 $124.00 $23.00 $19.00
KENOSHA NORTH SIDE FROM ELDER EAST TO PROPERTY LINE & 1
0N ON ELDER EAST SIDE FROM KENOSHA TO OAKLAND $40.00 $197.00 $44.00 $64.00
3N HOUSTON - CEDAR WEST TO FREEWILL CHURCH ! $5.00 $97.00 $21.00 $12.00
2N HOUSTON - FERN TO HICKORY PL NORTH SIDE 1 $25.00 $197.00 $44.00 $37.00
HOUSTON SOUTH SIDE FROM: WEST OF POPLAR TO PROPERTY LINE 1
BN TO: LIONS & ON LIONS WEST SIDE TO PROPERTY LINE $30.00 $197.00 $71.00 $37.00
34N HOUSTON NORTH SIDE FROM PROPERTY LINE TO PROPERTY LINE 1 $10.00 $114.00 $23.00 $13.00
5N HOUSTON - BEECH AVE WEST TO WEST SIDE OF CREEK 1 $22.00 $197.00 $36.00 $36.00
36N COLLEGE - 11TH TO 12TH SOUTH SIDE 1 $8.00 $97.00 $23.00 $13.00
37N HILLSIDE DR BETWEEN ALBANY & 9TH ! $60.00 No Bid $58.00 $105.00
38N 18T/ MIDWAY ( RHOADES DETENTION POND ) 1 $65.00 $297.00 $44.00 $108.00
39N SEATTLE & HICKORY ISLANDS 1 $32.00 $147.00 $36.00 $100.00
4N 1700 WEST DETROIT ( MAINTENANCE YARD ) 1 $5.00 $97.00 $23.00 $12.00
4N 1821 W DETROIT ( FIRE DEPT. RESOURCES ) 1 $15.00 $114.00 $30.00 $22.00
2N 485 N'POPLAR ( OPERATIONS ) 1 $40.00 $244.00 $23.00 $72.00
LANCASTER PARK DRAINAGE CANAL - SOUTH OF KENOSHA 1
N BETWEEN ASTER AVE & ASTER PL $125.00 NoBid $46.00 $260.00
Total $1,425.00 $6,681.00 $1,794.00 $2,484,00
Notes: Problen'fs with this
vendor in the past
Delivery

Street Department  Bids were sent out to 6 Vendors

Patrick Harrison ©

Purchasing Manager

‘This bid tabulation is true and accurate to the best of my knowledge
Monday March 08, 2021




