BID 24.157

AGGREGATE

BID OPENING DATE 6/07/24

Vendor Apac-Central, Inc. Anchor Stone Company
SPECIFICATION Pick up at Plant Pick up at Plant
Itern No. ITEM Price Per Ton Price Per Ton

1 1 1/2" Crusher Run §7.75 $8.00

2 3" Crusher Run §7.75 $8.00

3 12", 18" & 36" Rip Rap $22.00 $24.00

4 3/8 Asphalt Chips & 1/2" Chips $11.00 $11.50

5 11/2" Road Rock & 1 1/2" Clean $9.75 $10.50

6 Screenings $6.50 §7.25

7 6" Surge Rock no bid no bid

8 Gabion Stone no bid $21.00

9 Asphalt Millings no bid no bid

10 Type A Aggregate $8.25 $8.75

i1 | Pusged Ag‘sa’;f;fl‘z ;i;’(fzs()p" Hnox $8.25 $8.75

12 Delivery Cost per ton to City Yard L, Fiiisapl?%gta;; Gl ;Qf}zligp 13;) ?I;E.I;IO- Sk

NOTES **Bid Request 24.157 was sent out to five (5) Vendors with two (2) Vendors responding. This was
advertised on the City Website as well as the Tulsa World.

This bid tabulation is true and accurate to the best of my knowledge

ated: June 11th, 2024

/Hg/ T{//

Ryan Baze
General Services Director




