BROKEN ARROW

Where opportunity lives

Bid 26.152-Furniture for Operations Center - Admin Building Project #2317210

This solicitation establishes a purchase agreement for the procurement and installation of furniture. The awarded vendor shall furnish and install the
specified furniture items in the quantities listed in the bid at the quoted prices. All items and installation services must meet the required specifications
and delivery requirements outlined in this solicitation. The vendor shall be responsible for delivery, assembly, placement, and installation of all
furniture. Purchases will be made through issuance of a purchase order, and payment will be rendered Net 30 after receipt, installation, and
acceptance of items in accordance with standard purchasing procedures.

Description

Admiral Express, LLC Crown Office Furnishings L&M Office Furniture
Pricing Summa
g i Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded Unit Price Exte.n ded
Price Price Price
Item No. Section A - Seating
A-1 Guest Chairs (Lobby 100)| 2 $ 446.20| $ 89240 $ 340.20| $ 680.40| $ 410.96 | $ 821.92
A-2 Task Chairs (Multiple Offices)| 46 | $ 399.10| $ 18,358.60  $ 37422 $ 17,214.12 | $ 367.59| $ 16,909.14
A-3 Guest Chairs (IT, Utilities, Traffic Offices) 26 | $ 360.64| $ 9,376.64 | $ 340.20| $ 8,845.20 $ 33217 $ 8,636.42
A-4 Guest Chairs (Code Enforcement Offices) 14 | $ 360.64| $ 5,048.96 | $ 340.20| $ 4,762.80 | $ 33217 $ 4,650.38
A-5 Guest Chairs (Traffic / Streets & Storm Offices)] 26 | $ 360.64 | $ 9,376.64 | $ 340.20 | $ 8,845.20 $ 33217 $ 8,636.42
A-6 Counter Height Stools (Breakroom 108) 6 | $ 235.07 | $ 141042 $ 173.34| $ 1,040.04 | $ 216.51| $ 1,299.06
A7 Nesting Chairs (Meeting Room 152) 32 | $ 380.66 | $ 12,181.12 | $ 314.28 | $ 10,056.96 | $ 350.60 | $ 11,219.20
A-8 Bar Height Stools (Open Office 139)|] 8 $ 246.84| $ 1,974.72 | $ 17334 | § 1,386.72 | $ 22735 $ 1,818.80
A-9 Conference Chairs (Meeting Rooms / Private Offices) 39 | $ 582.95| $ 22,735.05 $ 426.46| $ 16,631.94 $ 516.24| $ 20,133.36
Item No. Section B - Tables & Work Surfaces| QTY
B-1 Bench (Lobby 100) 1 $ 1,389.99 § 1,389.99  § 845.64| $ 845.64 | $ 1,280.24 | $ 1,280.24
B-2 Side Table (Lobby 100)| 1 $ 586.86 | $ 586.86 | $ 287.95| $ 287.95| $ 576.87| $ 576.87
B-3 42" Meeting Tables| 7 $ 656.36| $ 4,594.45 | $ 642.08| $ 4,494.56 | $ 645.18| $ 4,516.26
B-4 60" Meeting Tables| 2 $ 3,032.86| $ 6,065.72 | $ 675.95| $ 1,351.90  $ 1,929.26 $ 3,858.52
B-5 48" x 96" Collaboration Table| 1 No Bid $ -3 1,414.60 $ 1,414.60  $ 1,088.72 | $ 1,088.72
B-6 48" Meeting Table| 1 $ 753.77| $ 753.77| $ 678.08| $ 678.08| $ 629.67| $ 629.67
B-7 42" x 96" Meeting Table| 1 $ 1,359.80  $ 1,359.80  $ 1,097.52 $ 1,097.52 | § 1,336.63 | $ 1,336.63
B-8 24" x 60" Training Tables (Meeting Room 152) 16 | $ 630.26 | $ 10,084.16  $ 695.38| $ 11,126.08  $ 619.52| $ 9,912.32
Item No. Section C - Storage & Casegoods| QTY
C-1 Bookcases| 3 $ 436.32| $ 1,308.96 | $ 496.12| $ 1,488.36 | $ 414.94 | $ 1,244.82
C-2 Lateral File / Bookcase Combo 1 $ 84451 $ 844.51 $ 1,082.56  $ 1,082.56 | $ 854.45| $ 854.45
C-3 Lateral Files| 2 $ 541.60| $ 1,083.20  $ 77881 $ 1,557.62 $ 566.38| $ 1,132.76
C-4 Credenzas (Meeting Rooms 140 & 142)| 2 No Bid $ - % 655.29 | $ 1,310.58 | $ 1,699.93  $ 3,399.86
C-5 Credenzas (Open Office / Meeting Room 152) 2 No Bid $ -1 3 1,501.74 | $ 3,00348  $ 2,162.80| $ 4,325.60
C-6 Storage Unit (Restroom 118) 1 $ 1,289.15 § 1,289.15 $ 325.00| $ 325.00| $ 1,234.64 $ 1,234.64
Magazine Rack (Lobby 100), 1 $ 705.02| $ 705.02| $ 118.00 | $ 118.00 | $ 577.98| $ 577.98
Item No. Section D - Wall-Mounted & Accessories| QTY
D-1 3'x 4' Glass Marker Boards|, 24 | $ 478.54 | $ 11,484.96 $ 566.68 | $ 13,600.32 $ 403.94 | $ 9,694.56
D-2 4'x 3' Glass Marker Boards| 2 | $ 47854 | $ 957.08 | $ 566.68 | $ 1,133.36 | $ 40394 $ 807.88
D-3 4' x 6' Glass Marker Boards| 6 $ 850.73| $ 5104.38 | $ 1,411.00 $ 8,466.00 $ 71812 $ 4,308.72
D-4 Wall Mounted Rack (Customer Service 145)| 1 No Bid $ -1 3 58.00 | $ 58.00 $ 252.98| $ 252.98
D-5 Wall Mounted Shelving (Location 162), 2 | $ 265.89| $ 531.78| $ 235.00| $ 470.00 | $ 234.94| $ 469.88
D-6 Wall Mounted Shelving (Storage 110), 4 $ 259.79| $ 1,039.16 | $ 255.00| $ 510.00| $ 240.96 | $ 963.84
Section E - Workstations & Office Systems
Item No. L - Shaped Private Office Workstations| QTY
E-1 L-Shaped Private Office Workstation (IT Office 124) 1 $ 1,300.57 | $ 1,300.57 | $ 1,484.59  $ 1,484.59  $ 1,242.13 | $ 1,242.13
E-2 L-Shaped Workstations — Left-Hand Returns| 10 | $ 1,877.94 $ 18,779.40 $ 2,015.28 $ 20,152.80  $ 1,837.21 $ 18,372.10
E-3 L-Shaped Workstations — Right-Hand Returns| 8 $ 1,877.94 $ 15,023.52  $ 2,015.28 $ 16,122.24  $ 1,837.21 $ 14,697.68
U - Shaped Private Office Workstations| QTY
E-4 U-Shaped Workstation (Streets & Storm Office 103) 1 $ 2,929.93 $ 2,92993 $ 3,285.62| $ 3,285.62 | $ 2,849.82 $ 2,849.82
E-5 U-Shaped Workstations (Code Enforcement Offices 116 & 117) 2 | $ 2,929.93 | $ 5,859.86 | $ 3,285.62| $ 6,571.24 | $ 2,849.82 $ 5,699.64
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Unit Price .
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Unit Price

Crown Office Furnishings

Unit Price
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Price Summary - Rates and Charges
Notary Public Commission Expires

$ 336,894.42
2/26/2029

2/21/2030

$ 288,892.67

12/18/2027

E-6 U-Shaped Workstations (Utilities Offices 133 & 134) 2 $ 1,812.19  § 3,624.38 | $ 2,13435  $ 4,268.70 | $ 1,723.37 | $ 3,446.74
E-7 U-Shaped Workstations (Streets & Storm Offices 105-107) 3 | $ 1,81219 $ 5,436.57 | $ 2,134.35 $ 6,403.05 $ 1,723.37 | $ 5,170.11
E-8 U-Shaped Workstation (Secondary EOC 161) 1 $ 4,34531 | $ 4,345.31 | $ 3,352.59| $ 3,352.59 | $ 4,378.38 | $ 4,378.38
Panel-Based Workstations (Open Offices)| QTY
E-9 Panel-Based Workstations — Right-Hand Returns (Traffic & Utilities Office 139)] 3 $ 3,693.29| $ 11,079.87  $ 2,938.19 | $ 8,814.57 | $ 3,382.32| $ 10,146.96
E-10 Panel-Based Workstations — Left-Hand Returns (Traffic & Utilities Office 139) 3 $ 3,693.29 $ 11,079.87 | $ 2,938.19 | $ 8,814.57 | $ 3,382.32| $ 10,146.96
E-11 Panel-Based Workstations — Right-Hand Returns (Code Enforcement Open Office 114) 9 $ 2,512.74 | $ 22,614.66  $ 2,242.96 | $ 20,186.64  $ 2,270.49 | $ 20,434.41
E-12 Panel-Based Workstations — Left-Hand Returns (Code Enforcement Open Office 114) 8 $ 2,512.74 | $ 20,101.92 § 2,242.96 | $ 17,943.68 $ 2,270.49 | $ 18,163.92
E-13 Panel-Based Workstations — Right-Hand Returns (IT Open Office 126) 3 | $ 2,904.09| $ 8,712.27 | $ 244410 $ 7,332.30| $ 2,798.90| $ 8,396.70
E-14 Panel-Based Workstations — Left-Hand Returns (IT Open Office 126)] 3 $ 2,904.09 $ 8,712.27 | $ 2,444.10 | $ 7,33230 | $ 2,798.90 | $ 8,396.70
E-15 Panel-Based Workstations — Right-Hand Returns (Utilities Open Office 148) 2 $ 3,939.18| $ 7,878.36 | $ 3,197.51| $ 6,395.02 | $ 3,681.27| $ 7,362.54
E-16 Panel-Based Workstations — Left-Hand Returns (Utilities Open Office 148) 2 $ 3,939.18| $ 7,878.36 | $ 3,197.51| $ 6,395.02 | $ 3,681.27| § 7,362.54
Section F - Delivery & Installation| QTY
Delivery, Assembly, Placement, and Installation (Lump Sum) $ 51,000.00 $ 20,155.00 $ 41,949.18
Total Bid Price
Total Sections A—E $ 285,894.42 $ 268,737.67 $ 272,859.23
Delivery & Installation $ 51,000.00 $ 20,155.00 $ 41,949.18
Total Bid Price $ 336,894.42 $ 288,892.67 $ 314,808.41

$ 314,808.41

3rd Lowest

Bid 26.152-Furniture for Operations Center - Admin Building Project #2317210
This was advertised on the City Website as well as the Tulsa World.

Bid was sent out to (4) Vendors with (3) Vendors responding.

This bid tabulation is true and accurate to the best of my knowledge.

6/5/2026

N Ey‘m Ba;,&

1st Lowest

Ryan Baze, General Services Director Date
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