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City of Broken Arrow  
     Drainage Advisory Committee 

 

PROJECT REPORT 

 

DATE:   January 16, 2025/April 24, 2025 

NAME  Patrick Wilson, City of Broken Arrow 

ADDRESS / 
LOCATION 

Covington Creek Tributary, City of Broken Arrow 

WATERSHED  Adams Creek 

ESTIMATE  $500,000 

CASE NO. 25-005 

 

DESCRIPTION 

 Deer Creek, an Unnamed Tributary to Covington Creek, and Covington Creek are experiencing 

increased erosion due to high velocity.  The higher velocities create an erosive force that breakdown 

creek embankments, transports suspended soil particles and deposits sediments along these drainage 

ways.  The sediments build up and trap floating debris, which blocks and impedes flow in the creek.  In 

addition, the increased velocities due to the blockages under cut and erode away embankment 

material that supports vegetation as well as public and private infrastructure along the creek banks.  All 

3 creeks are located on private property owned by an HOA or individual homeowners.  See attached 

report dated July 2020. 

The Drainage Advisory Committee recommended on 7/27/20 and Council approved on 8/18/20 the 

expenditure of $35,000.00 for design and construction plans to mitigate the creeks mentioned above.   

The Drainage Advisory Committee recommended on 2/28/22 and Council approved on 3/21/22 the 

expenditure of $30,000.00 for applying for an Individual 404 Permit from the United States Army Corps 

of Engineers and to finalize the construction documents. 

The USACE Individual Permit has been processed and was executed by the City of Broken Arrow on 

April 17, 2025. 

A Floodplain Development Permit still needs to be submitted to the City of Broken Arrow. 

The conceptual construction cost estimate was approximately $480.000.00 (2020 dollars).  After the 

design was complete the construction cost estimate increased to about $1,137,000.00 (2022 dollars).  

The current construction cost estimate is $1,200,000. 

The HOA has requested a partnership with the City of Broken Arrow to share the construction costs. 
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 BENEFIT  

 Mitigate the erosion to re-establish banks to protect an exposed City storm sewer headwall and a utility 

pole at the edge of the bank while reducing the flooding impacts. 

 

 

  

 RECOMMENDATION  

 Approve the request for expenditure of $500,000 to construct erosion control and channel stabilization 

of Covington Creek Tributary.  

 

  

 COMPLETED BY:             Patrick Wilson                                    DATE:  1/16/25 & 4/24/25  
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City of Broken Arrow 
     Drainage Advisory Committee

APPLICATION

DATE:  1-16-2025

OWNER NAME: Forest Ridge Homeowner’s Association

PHONE NUMBER:

EMAIL ADDRESS:

OWNER MAILING 
ADDRESS:

404 N Forest Ridge Blvd, Broken Arrow, OK 74014

ADDRESS OF 
PROPERTY WITH 
DRAINAGE PROBLEM:

Numerous properties in Deer Creek, Stanford Landing, Wyckford, Covington Estates 
(West) and Coving Estates (East) subdivision.  See Map

LOCATION OF 
DRAINAGE ISSUE ON 
PROPERTY: 

In the man-made channel along Covington Creek Tributary

DESCRIPTION OF PROBLEM:           (*PHOTOS SHOULD ACCOMPANY APPLICATION)

 Copied from DAC application presented 7/27/2020.

 The man-made channel between the Stanford Landing Subdivision, Wyckford Subdivision and 
Covington Estates Subdivisions has eroded over time to the point that pedestrian trails, stormwater 
infrastructure and trees are in danger of falling into the channel and, thereby, creating significant 
blockages to the flow.  This is very concerning because just a small amount of blockage can have a 
tremendous impact on whether or not properties flood during routine storm events.  It is important for 
the channel to be maintained and kept free of debris and sedimentation deposits as much as 
practicable.  The vast majority to almost the entirety of the channel is located in a drainage easement 
in the Covington Estates subdivisions.  One of the subdivisions is under the jurisdiction of Wagoner 
County.  The Forest Ridge Home Owner’s Association and the residents of Covington Estates have 
agreed, in concept, to work with the City of Broken Arrow in an collaborative effort to mitigate the 
effects of erosion in this channel in order to better protect all residents in this vicinity.  The Forest 
Ridge Home Owner’s Association has agreed, in concept to this point, to help fund the construction 
of certain improvements.  The Forest Ridge Homeowner’s Association and the individual residents in 
Covington Estates (West) are seeking the City of Broken Arrow’s assistance under the 2018 General 
Obligation Bond Program, Proposition 6 funds.

Signature:  

RETURN TO STORMWATER DIVISION MANAGER’S OFFICE, PO BOX 610 Broken Arrow, OK 74013
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EXECUTIVE SUMMARY 
 
In 2014, the Forest Ridge Homeowners Association (FRHOA) in connection with the Robson 
Companies, Inc. commenced with the construction of a segmental retaining structure within a man-
made “cut-off” channel in order to prevent and mitigate the effects and impacts from continued 
erosion along the sides of the channel that is adjacent to the Forest Ridge golf course, which is 
now Wyckford at Forest Ridge subdivision.  Although the initial construction of the retaining 
structure was located within a platted public drainage easement, it was later deemed improper by 
the Wagoner County District Attorney’s office due to the fact that the FRHOA did not have the 
legal and proper authority to construct any improvements within the drainage easement.  The 
construction effort has ceased and has not reconvened since late 2014. 
 
Although this matter is considered a private property owner dispute, it has intertwined and 
involved officials from both Wagoner County and the City of Broken Arrow, as well as private 
professional engineering consultants.  In 2018, after several attempts to resolve the conflict 
between the two (2) disputing parties, the FRHOA filed a lawsuit against the seven (7) adjacent 
property owners located in the Covington Estates (West) subdivision immediately north of the 
Forest Ridge golf course, now Wyckford at Forest Ridge subdivision.  The lawsuit essentially 
claims that these seven (7) individuals have not provided the essential care and maintenance 
necessary to the man-made “cut-off” channel running across their individual properties, thereby 
allowing erosion to occur and damaging the adjacent FRHOA property.  In turn, the individual 
property owners in Covington Estates have essentially stated, but not yet filed to the City’s 
knowledge a counter lawsuit that the developers of the Forest Ridge subdivisions have increased 
stormwater flow onto their property that has adversely impacted and damaged their properties and 
property values. 
 
During the 2018 General Obligation promotion meetings, representatives of the FRHOA 
questioned City representatives on whether or not Proposition No. 6 – Drainage funds could be 
utilized to finance an improvement to this “cut-off” channel.  After some internal discussions, the 
City stated that there was a possibility that these funds might be available for such a project.  
Obviously, much more detail is required before a definitive answer could be provided.    
Regardless, any project that might be developed for Council’s consideration absolutely must 
provide a direct and definable benefit to the residents of Broken Arrow. 
 
Recently, after the passage of the 2018 General Obligation Bond and the FRHOA’s filing of the 
lawsuit, both the FRHOA and the Covington Estates residents have reached out to the City of 
Broken Arrow and requested assistance in efforts to improve the drainage courses such that the 
public, specifically the residents of Broken Arrow experience a benefit.  Staff believes that there 
may be an opportunity to address the continual and routine flooding as well as erosion related 
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issues immediately in this specific area.  A more global and encompassing solution could produce 
a better and positive overall impact to all surrounding residents in this vicinity. 
 
It is crucial to note that since some of the property in question lies outside of the city’s jurisdiction 
and could be problematic regarding potential expenditures, the FRHOA has offered to pay some 
costs specifically associated with those areas located along the stretch of the channel where it abuts 
city and county jurisdiction. 
 
Lastly, it should be noted that Staff has not developed a project at this time, but instead desires to 
seek the Council’s input in this highly volatile matter before any further engagement commences.  
The following attached report provides significant details regarding this matter. 
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DETAILED REPORT 
 
Introduction.  Associated with the preparation and then subsequent passage of the 2018 General 
Obligation Bond Program, a representative of the Forest Ridge Homeowner’s Association 
(FRHOA) asked if the Proposition 6: Drainage funds could be used for a specific project in the 
Forest Ridge community.  The area in question is the man-made creek channelization section that 
runs from west to east along the northern border of the Deer Creek at Forest Ridge subdivision and 
a portion of the former Forest Ridge Golf Course area, now Wyckford at Forest Ridge subdivision, 
coupled with the southern border of the Covington Estates subdivision.  The proposed project in 
question is an embankment stabilization effort and a stormwater conveyance improvement effort 
along this specific section of the drainage way. 
 
Background. The Covington Creek watershed has a significant history of being a challenging 
drainage basin with regards to flooding and erosion effects since long before the Robson 
Companies began to develop the Forest Ridge planned community.  In fact, the Oklahoma 
Department of Transportation (ODOT) indicates that the high water mark prior to the widening of 
the Kenosha Street (East 71st Street South) in the early 1980s is still above the current-day 100-
year (1% chance) base flood elevation (BFE).  This fact is evidenced in the Oklahoma Department 
of Transportation construction plans for Kenosha Street widening dated 1980. 
 
The Covington Creek watershed lies within the larger Adams Creek watershed, which drains to 
the Verdigris River.  The Covington Creek drainage basin consists of 5.92 square miles (3,789 
acres).  It begins just south of State of Oklahoma Highway 51 and meanders in a northerly manner 
6.3 miles to its confluence with Adams Creek approximately one-half mile north of Kenosha Street 
and one-quarter mile east of East 65th Street South (Oneta Road).  Please refer to Exhibit A for 
further clarity. 
 
As Wagoner County began to develop and new residential, commercial and industrial subdivisions 
were platted, stormwater runoff increased due to the increased impervious areas in this basin until 
government regulations required on-site detention to offset this increased runoff.  In efforts to 
address this increase in stormwater runoff in this area, as well as in their respective jurisdictions 
as a whole, local and county governments enacted subdivision regulations and stormwater 
management ordinances to counter-act the effects of increased stormwater runoff.  The City of 
Broken Arrow was first to establish an ordinance regarding stormwater management in 1977 and 
followed up with a much more restrictive stormwater management ordinance adopted on April 25, 
2002.  Around the late 1980s to the early 1990s, Wagoner County likewise adopted subdivision 
regulations that required restrictive stormwater management approaches.  On April 16, 2012, 
Wagoner County adopted a Flood Damage Prevention ordinance that provided much more 
restrictive criteria than prior approaches for development.  
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Development Area.  Wagoner County records indicate that on March 6, 1974, the developers of 
the original Allison Estates Second subdivision filed a plat with the Wagoner County Clerk.  On 
May 8, 1975, the owners filed a replat of the Allison Estates subdivision in Wagoner County and 
changed the name to Covington Estates subdivision.  Both the original plat and the subsequent 
replat of this addition show a 30-foot to 40-foot platted drainage easement along the southern 
border of the subdivision, as well as a double 40-foot for a total of an 80-foot platted drainage 
easement running diagonally through the center of the subdivision.  In April of 1989, the City of 
Broken Arrow prepared sanitary sewer plans for construction in order to install a new lift station 
and collection system as a part of an assessment district to incorporate the eastern half of Covington 
Estates subdivision into the city limits of Broken Arrow.  The division line was the diagonal 
channel that ran through the middle of the Covington Estates subdivision.  Please refer to Exhibit 
B for details of the drainage easement in question. 
 
In 1986, shortly after the Covington Estates subdivision was re-platted, the Robson Companies 
began to develop the Forest Ridge subdivisions, a master planned, resort style, community in this 
same watershed.  This community includes numerous subdivisions positioned around an athletic 
club and golf course.  Currently, in July 2020, there are 15 individual subdivisions located on 
nearly 1,100 acres plus one (1) additional subdivision in the early phases of construction.  These 
subdivisions are largely located south of Kenosha Street (East 71st Street South) and extend about 
one-half mile south of Houston Street (East 81st Street South) and are generally positioned along 
four (4) individual creeks: Covington Creek, an unnamed Covington Creek tributary, Timber 
Creek and Deer Creek.  The majority of these subdivisions are located east of 65th Street (South 
241st East Avenue also known as Oneta Road) and west of 79th Street (South 257th East Avenue 
also known as Midway Road). 
 
Most crucial to these discussions are those subdivisions that drain directly to Covington Creek on 
the eastern side of the Forest Ridge community, the unnamed tributary in the center of the 
development that drains into Covington Creek and, lastly, Deer Creek along the western boundary 
of the community that drains into the unnamed tributary.  Please refer to Exhibit C for clarity of 
the proposed project area. 
 
Covington Estates Subdivision History.  In 1974, when the Sandlane Investment Company 
platted the original Allison Estates Second subdivision, which later was re-platted as the Covington 
Estates subdivision, and began construction on the public improvements, the developer constructed 
man-made channels that essentially redirected the stormwater runoff collected in all three (3) 
creeks (Covington Creek, the unnamed tributary of Covington Creek and Deer Creek) and rerouted 
the stormwater through the subdivision.  The developer constructed two (2) “cut-off” channels to 
reroute the runoff to a single main channel that drained through the center of the Covington Estates 
subdivision. 
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One “cut-off” channel runs eastward about 1,400 feet from Deer Creek on the far western side of 
the subdivision due east to the point at which the main channel was constructed.  In addition, this 
particular channel intercepts the unnamed tributary of Covington Creek about midway between 
Deer Creek and the main channel.  The other “cut-off” channel runs westward about 400 feet east 
of the main channel and collects Covington Creek near the midpoint of the channel.  Both channels 
reroute the upstream stormwater runoff to the main channel. 
 
At this juncture, the developer essentially rerouted all three (3) creeks and combined them in one 
(1) main man-made channel that divided the subdivision into two (2) halves.  One-half (1/2) on 
the western side of the channel and one-half (1/2) on the eastern side of the channel.  This main 
channel runs generally in a northwest direction through the subdivision. 
 
These three (3) different “cut-off” channel segments consist of varying drainage easement widths 
along the southern side of the Covington Estates’ properties.  The western “cut-off” channel was 
placed within a 40-foot wide drainage easement, except for one section that was placed within a 
30-foot wide drainage easement.  The eastern “cut-off” channel was placed within a 20-foot wide 
drainage easement.  The main channel was placed within an 80-foot wide drainage easement. 
 
Forest Ridge Subdivision History.  In the late 1980s, the Robson Companies, Inc. constructed 
the Forest Ridge golf course.  A portion of the golf course ran alongside the Covington Estates’ 
man-made “cut-off” channels along the southern border of the subdivision.  Over time, Forest 
Ridge developed residential subdivisions around the golf course and the Covington Estates 
subdivision.  Some subdivisions were developed along Covington Creek main stem.  Others were 
developed west of the main stem along an unnamed tributary of Covington Creek and along Deer 
Creek, while other subdivisions were developed to the north and east of the main stem along 
Timber Creek.  The main focus of this report are those subdivisions developed along Deer Creek 
and along the unnamed tributary to the west of the confluence of Covington Creek. 
 
A few of the more pertinent subdivisions regarding this particular issue and that drain directly into 
this man-made channel include the following: Deer Creek at Forest Ridge, Deer Creek II at Forest 
Ridge, Deer Creek III at Forest Ridge, Stanford’s Landing I at Forest Ridge, Stanford’s Landing 
II at Forest Ridge, Stanford’s Landing III at Forest Ridge, The Highlands I at Forest Ridge, The 
Highlands II at Forest Ridge, The Highlands III at Forest Ridge, The Highlands IV at Forest Ridge, 
and now Wyckford at Forest Ridge.  Essentially, this equates to the southeast quarter of Section 9, 
the southwest quarter of Section 10, the northwest quarter of Section 15, and the northeast quarter 
of Section 16 all in Township 18 North and Range 15 East, based upon the Indian Meridian.  The 
drainage area is approximately one square mile.  All the subdivisions identified above are located 
within the city limits of Broken Arrow.  Please refer to Table 1 for identification of all pertinent 
subdivisions that affect these drainage ways. 
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Drainage Issue.  Historically, the Covington Estates subdivision west and to a lesser extent to the 
east of the main channel has experienced significant flooding.  The flooding largely affects 
property owners that reside outside of the jurisdiction of the city; however, several property owners 
that reside within the city limits are affected as well. 
 
Not only does this area experience repeat flooding, but the energy within routine stormwater runoff 
flows create erosive forces that breakdown creek embankments, transports suspended soil particles 
and deposits sediments along these drainage ways.  These sediments build up and trap floating 
debris, which blocks and impedes flow in the creek.  In addition, the increased velocities due to 
the blockages under cut and erode away embankment material that supports vegetation as well as 
public and private stormwater infrastructure along the creek banks. 
 
Potential Mitigation Efforts.  Both the FRHOA and the Covington Estates’ affected property 
owners have agreed in concept that if the City of Broken Arrow could participate in a more global 
solution that benefited all parties including FRHOA, the Covington Estates residents and the 
residents of Broken Arrow in the project vicinity, then the parties in conflict would be willing to 
work together to resolve the matter. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

































Erosion Along Deer Creek



Erosion Along Deer Creek – Trail Crossing



Erosion Along Deer Creek – Trail Crossing



Erosion Along Deer Creek & Confluence of Deer Creek & Covington Tributary



Erosion Along Covington Creek Tributary



Erosion Along Covington Creek Tributary



Erosion Along Covington Creek Tributary
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