RFQ 21.135
STORMWATER GROUND MAINTENANCE - SOUTH

Bid Date 03/10/2021
Vendor JAND JBOWERs | WCPENTERERISES | goupcEONE | LAWNS OF TULSA
Item . . . . .
Number Materials Qty. Each Price Each Price Each Price Each Price
ELM - ATLANTA TO FIRST CHRISTIAN
s CHURCH WEST SIDE 1 $35.00 $36.00 $43.00 $197.00
2§ |ELM-FFULTON TO ITHICA BAST SIDE| 1 $20.00 $18.00 $43.00 $194.00
ELM - QUANTICO TO N BOWLING
is ALLY ENTRANCE EAST SIDE 1 $83.00 $110.00 $114.00 $297.00
ELM - S COMMERCIAL OFFICE
COMPLEX TO APARTMENT 1 $43.00 $68.00 $58.00 $247.00
48 COMPLEX WEST SIDE
55 ELM N/S OF KEY WEST WEST SIDE 1 $10.00 $11.00 $28.00 $147.00
BLM-LOS ANGELES TOMIAMIEAST| $10.00 $10.00 $43.00 $147.00
65
ELM - MIAMITO CREEK TURNPIKE $10.00 $7.00 $36.00 $124.00
7s EAST SIDE
ELM - SOUTHPARK ASSEMBLY TO
. CREEK TURNPIKE WEST SIDE 1 $10.00 $10.00 $21.00 $114.00
ELM - SOUTH OF QUANAH TO CREEK
o TURNPIKE EAST SIDE 1 $12.00 $37.00 $36.00 $147.00
ELM - SOUTHRIDGE CENTER SOUTH
TO NORTH BOUNDRY OF 1 $18.00 $13.00 $36.00 No Bid
108 SUBDIVISION EAST SIDE
ELM - CHARLOTTE TO WINSTON
EAST SIDE 1 $70.00 $105.00 $85.00 $297.00
118
ELM PL WEST SIDE - FROM: NORTH
OF ALBQUERQUE TO PROPERTY LINE
TO: SOUTH OF DECATUR TO 1 $40.00 $40.00 $58.00 $247.00
2s PROPERTY LINE
ELM - CHARLOT';’IEDEO 128THSTEAST| $58.00 $87.00 $64.00 $297.00
138
ELM - NORTH OF GLENWOOD TO
s FIRE STATION #3 WEST SIDE 1 $87.00 $125.00 $114.00 $247.00
ASPEN EAST S"Jf g;‘OM CANTONTO| $39.00 $40.00 $58.00 $224.00
158
ASPEN - NORT‘(‘)OF DELMAR SOUTH | $30.00 $35.00 $43.00 $147.00
165 TO GARY
175 | ASPEN - GARY TO ITHICA EAST SIDE 1 $18.00 $16.00 $43.00 $197.00
ASPEN - NEW ORLEANS SOUTH TO
s PRIVACY FENCE 1 $29.00 $30.00 $43.00 $197.00
ASPEN - 260 FT. S. OF PHEONIX AND i
TO FAMILY VIDEO PROPERTY LINE 1 $29.00 $31.00 $58.00 $197.00
198 EAST SIDE
208 ASPEN - N & S OF UTICA 1 $29.00 $30.00 $50.00 $247.00
ASPEN CREEK DR - N OF WAL-MART
TOP & BOTTOM OF WALL TO WAL- 1 $33.00 $36.00 $28.00 $197.00
218 MART PROPERTY LINE
WASHINGTON - MAIN ST. TO ELM
s NORTH SIDE 1 $28.00 $37.00 $58.00 $197.00
WASHINGTON - STAR CENTER WEST
TO SUBDIVISION BOUNDRY SOUTH 1 $27.00 $29.00 $36.00 $197.00
238 SIDE




WASHINGTON SOUTH SIDE FROM

s LOT TO DRIVEWAY $63.00 $100.00 $58.00 $247.00
WASHINGTON - PINE AVE TO BOYS
25 CLUB NORTH SIDE $55.00 $96.00 $58.00 $297.00
WASHINGTON - IDC CENTER EAST TO
SPRUCE AVE $10.00 $7.00 $28.00 $147.00
268
WASHINGTON - WILLOW TO WEST .
s TO END OF PRIVACY FENCE $20.00 $18.00 $28.00 No Bid
NEW ORLEANS - 1ST WEST TO ASH
CT. NORTH SIDE $47.00 $72.00 $64.00 $247.00
288
NEW ORLEANS - TACO BELL WEST
105 TO DOLLAR GENERAL NORTH SIDE $82.00 $125.00 $79.00 $297.00
NEW ORLEANS - PSO POWER PLANT
05 WEST TO SYCAMORE SOUTH SIDE $43.00 $60.00 $58.00 $197.00
NEW ORLEANS - CHESTNUT TO
s DOGWOOD NORTH SIDE $29.00 $31.00 $43.00 $197.00
FLORENCE SOUTH SIDE FROM
335 | PROPERTY LINE TO PROPERTY LINE §43.00 $60.00 $58.00 $197.00
FLORENCE - E/W OF ASHDR. NORTH $18.00 $44.00 $104.00 $197.00
338
FLORENCE - EAST AND WEST OF
s DATE TO PROPERTY LINES $30.00 $31.00 $43.00 $197.00
FLORENCE - WALGREENS TO MAPLE .
NORTH SIDE $77.00 $96.00 $102.00 No Bid
358
FLORENCE - HICKORY TO JUNIPER
SOUTH SIDE $19.00 $13.00 $36.00 $174.00
368
TUCSON - 5TH ST WEST TO PRIVACY
s FENCE NORTH SIDE $38.00 $70.00 $71.00 $297.00
TUCSON - CEDAR EAST TO END OF
s PRIVACY FENCE NORTH SIDE $70.00 $95.00 $43.00 $297.00
TUCSON-DATE 19 CEDAR NORTH $48.00 $38.00 $36.00 $247.00
398
408 2302 S. 1ST ST S/S OPERATIONS $30.00 $19.00 $58.00 $244.00
418 2304 8. 1ST ST $25.00 $18.00 $58.00 $244.00
258 LAREDO AND 1ST CENTER ISLAND $5.00 $7.00 $34.00 No Bid
435 | IST THIRD LOT SOUTH OF UNION ST $15.00 $10.00 $28.00 $147.00
Total $1,535.00 $1,971.00 $2,283.00 $8,372.00
Notes: Problems with
' vendor in the past
Delivery

Street Department Bids were sent out to 6 Vendors

This bid tabulation is true and accurate to the best of my knowledge

\Q W Wednesday, March 10, 2021

P!trick Harrison

Purchasing Manager




