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Date:___________________________X_____________________________________________

Due to the extensive parts list, each line highlights the least amount. We will utiltize all 6 vendors for 
availablilty and lead times.

Bid 26.121- Utility Stock Items for Purchasing Warehouse  Annual Agreement 2025-2026

 Ryan Baze, General Services Director

Description: This will be a time and materials agreement for electrical services. The awarded vendor will 
provide labor, materials, and equipment necessary to perform electrical work as specified in this 
solicitation. Pricing shall be based on an hourly labor rate for service technicians, along with material 
costs as needed. Payment will be made based on actual work performed, subject to inspection and 
approval to ensure compliance with applicable codes and project specifications.

Price Summary - Rates and Charges

Additional Comments
Notary Public Commission Expires

Bid 26.121- Utility Stock Items for Purchasing Warehouse  Annual Agreement 2025-2026
This was advertised on the City Website as well as the Tulsa World.
Bid was sent out to (5) five Vendors with (6) six Vendors responding.      
This bid tabulation is true and accurate to the best of my knowledge.  

11/20/2025
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Description 
Consolidated 
Pipe & 
Supply 

Core & 
Main LP 

Ferguson 
Enterprise 

Fortiline 
Waterworks 

Tulsa 
Winwater 
Company 

Utility 
Supply 

3/4" pk x cc Corp Stop $47.12 $34.86 $34.78 $33.06 $32.72 $35.49 

3/4" cf x cc Corp Stop $43.83 $32.43 $32.44 $30.75 $30.44 $33.00 

3/4" pk x mcn Curb Stop $99.37 $73.50 $74.14 $69.73 $69.02 $74.90 

3/4" cf x fip Curb Stop $87.68 $64.85 $67.71 $61.52 $60.89 $66.05 

3/4" pk x fip Curb Stop $86.78 $64.21 $65.16 $60.89 $60.27 $65.40 

3/4" cf x mcn Curb Stop $90.77 $67.05 $45.25 $63.69 $63.04 $68.35 

3/4" pk x pk Curb Stop $98.49 $72.80 $71.24 $69.11 $68.40 $74.20 

3/4" cf x mcn "Texas" Stop $63.41 $57.08 $55.82 $37.76 $44.04 $58.20 

3/4" pk x mcn "Texas" Stop $57.35 $42.40 $41.34 $40.24 $39.83 $43.20 

3/4" pk x mcn Coupling $26.91 $19.93 $31.81 $18.88 $18.69 $20.28 

3/4" pk x mip Adapter $21.61 $15.99 $15.92 $15.16 $15.02 $16.27 

3/4" pk x pk Coupling $26.30 $19.48 $19.53 $18.45 $18.27 $19.83 

3/4" cf x cf Coupling $24.24 $17.97 $17.97 $17.01 $16.84 $18.85 

3/4" pk x pk 90° Bend $33.98 $25.15 $23.88 $23.80 $23.60 $25.60 
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Description 
Consolidated 
Pipe & 
Supply 

Core & 
Main LP 

Ferguson 
Enterprise 

Fortiline 
Waterworks 

Tulsa 
Winwater 
Company 

Utility 
Supply 

3/4" pk x fip Adapter $22.72 $16.83 $17.06 $15.94 $15.79 $18.50 

3/4" pk x mcn 90° Bend $30.58 $22.55 $36.69 $21.45 $21.23 $23.70 

3/4" Meter Nipple (2 1/2") $14.03 $10.40 $8.22 $9.84 $9.07 $10.50 

3/4" Meter Nipple (2") $14.03 $10.40 $15.12 $9.84 $9.74 $10.50 

3/4" Meter Nipple 90° $20.60 $15.49 $14.92 $13.49 $14.31 $16.00 

3/4" pk Corp 90° Bend   $33.19 $6.10 $NO BID $NO BID $NO BID $45.00 

3/4" Rubber Gaskets $.37 $.10 $.33 $NO BID $NO BID $.12 

3/4" Fiber Gastets (1/8") $1.38 $.18 $.27 $NO BID $NO BID $.52 

3/4" Fiber Gaskets (1/16") $1.21 $.18 $NO BID $NO BID $NO BID $.22 

3/4" Fiber Gaskets (1/32") $2.10 $.10 $NO BID $NO BID $NO BID $.22 

3/4" s x fip PVC Adapter $.44 $.38 $.78 $.36 $.34 $.36 

3/4" s x mip  PVC Adapter $.43 $.30 $.54 $.27 $.23 $.24 

3/4" s x s PVC 90° Bend $.50 $.32 $.58 $.29 $.26 $.28 

3/4" s x t PVC 90° Bend $.42 $.38 $.80 $.37 $NO BID $.39 
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Description 
Consolidated 
Pipe & 
Supply 

Core & 
Main LP 

Ferguson 
Enterprise 

Fortiline 
Waterworks 

Tulsa 
Winwater 
Company 

Utility 
Supply 

3/4" s x s PVC Coupling $.41 $.21 $.50 $.25 $NO BID $.24 

3/4" s x s PVC 45° Bend $.80 $.61 $1.40 $.74 $.59 $.65 

3/4" Sch. 40 PVC Pipe $.41 $.40 $.20 PER 
FT $.16/LF $.20 $.23 

3/4" PEX $1.09 $.78 $116.59 $1.10/LF $90.47 $1.13 

4" x 3/4" Tapping Saddle $126.60 $93.63 $97.63 $91.42 $106.57 $98.00 

6" x 3/4" Tapping Saddle $149.11 $110.28 $114.98 $107.68 $131.88 $113.24 

8" x 3/4" Tapping Saddle $184.55 $136.46 $142.35 $133.26 $191.22 $140.00 

12" x 3/4" Tapping Saddle $267.57 $197.85 $206.44 $193.23 $59.37 $209.00 

2" x 1 1/2" cc Bushing Reducer $59.84 $44.24 $63.23 $59.98 $138.84 $55.00 

8" x 1 1/2" Tapping Saddle $194.28 $143.75 $149.84 $140.29 $121.85 $150.00 

6" x 1 1/2" Tapping Saddle $170.50 $126.15 $131.47 $123.12 $105.52 $134.00 

4" x 1 1/2" Tapping Saddle $147.65 $109.28 $113.87 $106.62 $327.97 $125.00 

16" x 1" Tapping Saddle $458.93 $339.75 $525.86 $331.41 $426.98 $349.00 

24" x 1" Tapping Saddle $597.49 $442.35 $751.40 $431.47 $163.40 $500.00 
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Description 
Consolidated 
Pipe & 
Supply 

Core & 
Main LP 

Ferguson 
Enterprise 

Fortiline 
Waterworks 

Tulsa 
Winwater 
Company 

Utility 
Supply 

10" x 1" Tapping Saddle $228.65 $169.45 $176.36 $165.11 $192.71 $175.00 

10" x 2" Tapping Saddle $269.67 $199.77 $208.10 $194.73 $128.69 $208.00 

1 1/2" cc x mip Corp Stop $185.31 $137.15 $149.39 $132.31 $172.27 $155.00 

1 1/2" fip x flange Curb Stop $248.05 $183.70 $169.33 $174.07 $166.20 $187.00 

1 1/2" fip x fip Curb Stop $239.33 $174.55 $179.97 $167.94 $337.42 $225.00 

1 1/2" pk x mip adapter $70.09 $52.00 $52.06 $49.17 $33.97 $52.83 

1 1/2" pk x fip adapter $89.66 $66.30 $66.57 $62.91 $62.27 $67.57 

1 ½” pk x pk coupling $100.67 $74.47 $74.78 $70.65 $69.92 $75.90 

1 1/2" pk x pk 90° Bend $140.59 $103.75 $104.20 $98.41 $97.39 $105.70 

1 1/2" fip x fip 90° Bend $15.06 $56.15 $28.58 $NO BID $17.06 $96.00 

1 1/2" mip x fip Street 90° Bend $17.72 $63.75 $29.66 $NO BID $23.92 $105.00 

1 1/2" Union $27.90 $117.15 $40.86 $NO BID $33.28 $130.00 

1 1/2" x 6" Brass Nipple $19.69 $30.00 $27.88 $NO BID $23.15 $40.00 

1 1/2" x 12" Brass Nipple $38.37 $59.15 $54.70 $NO BID $45.43 $81.00 
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Description 
Consolidated 
Pipe & 
Supply 

Core & 
Main LP 

Ferguson 
Enterprise 

Fortiline 
Waterworks 

Tulsa 
Winwater 
Company 

Utility 
Supply 

1 1/2" Compression Coupling $100.67 $74.50 $71.88 $70.65 $69.92 $187.00 

3/4" PD Meter (Body Only) $NO BID $95.00 $279.00 $NO BID $NO BID $NO BID 

1" PD Meter $NO BID $420.00 $532.00 $NO BID $NO BID $NO BID 

1 1/2" PD Meter $NO BID $970.00 $1,327.00 $NO BID $NO BID $NO BID 

1 1/2"Turbine Meter $NO BID $970.00 $1,078.56 $NO BID $NO BID $NO BID 

2" PD Meter $NO BID $1,020.00 $1,627.00 $NO BID $NO BID $NO BID 

2" Turbine Meter $NO BID $1,135.00 $1,072.68 $NO BID $NO BID $NO BID 

2" Compound Meter $NO BID $2000.00 $1,578.68 $NO BID $NO BID $NO BID 

1 1/2" Meter Flange $25.40 $41.15 $104.77 $43.82 $NO BID $NO BID 

Meter Box $NO BID $42.00 $326.63 $39.83 $NO BID $NO BID 

Meter Box Lid $NO BID $28.15 $318.51 $25.59 $NO BID $NO BID 

PVC "Fast Dry" Cement $25.33 $28.00 $62.56 $NO BID $NO BID $29.00 

PVC Cement $7.19 $13.41 $20.40 $NO BID $NO BID $7.25 

PVC Primer $13.81 $12.00 $8.76 $13.50 $NO BID $14.50 
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Description 
Consolidated 
Pipe & 
Supply 

Core & 
Main LP 

Ferguson 
Enterprise 

Fortiline 
Waterworks 

Tulsa 
Winwater 
Company 

Utility 
Supply 

1" pk x cc Corp Stop $71.28 $52.70 $52.73 $50.02 $49.50 $53.70 

1" cf x cc Corp Stop $66.97 $49.50 $49.56 $47.00 $46.52 $50.45 

1" pk x mcn Curb Stop $146.84 $108.60 $107.17 $103.05 $101.98 $110.70 

1" cf x fip Curb Stop $123.81 $91.50 $45.74 $86.87 $85.97 $93.30 

1" pk x fip Curb Stop $131.68 $97.35 $NO BID $92.41 $91.45 $99.30 

1" cf x mcn Curb Stop $141.58 $104.68 $107.17 $99.35 $98.30 $109.00 

1" pk x pk Curb Stop $146.51 $108.30 $45.74 $102.81 $101.74 $110.40 

1"PVC pk x 3/4"mcn Texas Stop $95.12 $57.10 $NO BID $56.36 $NO BID $60.00 

1"x 3/4" x 3/4" pk Tee $68.00 $50.30 $47.68 $47.72 $48.58 $52.50 

1" pk x mcn Coupling $36.27 $26.85 $11.11 $25.45 $25.19 $27.32 

1" pk x mip Adapter $25.60 $19.00 $18.85 $17.96 $17.79 $19.28 

1" pk x pk Coupling $30.09 $22.28 $21.22 $21.11 $20.90 $22.68 

1" cf x cf Coupling $42.49 $31.45 $22.85 $29.82 $29.52 $33.00 

1" pk x pk 90° Bend $43.71 $32.31 $30.76 $30.67 $30.36 $32.90 
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Consolidated 
Pipe & 
Supply 

Core & 
Main LP 

Ferguson 
Enterprise 

Fortiline 
Waterworks 

Tulsa 
Winwater 
Company 

Utility 
Supply 

1" x 3/4" pk x pk 90° Bend $38.30 $28.80 $NO BID $26.88 $26.61 $32.00 

1" pk x mcn 90° Bend $48.38 $35.72 $52.06 $33.95 $33.61 $36.50 

1" mcn x mip Meter Nipple $21.01 $18.20 $11.10 $15.16 $17.27 $19.00 

1" x 3/4" pk Reducer $30.56 $22.64 $NO BID $21.44 $21.22 $23.03 

1" x 3/4" cc Bushing Reducer $18.18 $13.51 $37.85 $18.22 $18.04 $16.00 

1" x 3/4" ip Bushing Reducer $13.91 $10.45 $5.42 $13.94 $13.81 $13.00 

1" Rubber Gaskets $.39 $.12 $.36 $NO BID $NO BID $.25 

1" Fiber Gaskets (1/8") $1.74 $.70 $.60 $NO BID $NO BID $1.01 

1" Fiber Gaskets (1/16") $3.62 $.15 $NO BID $NO BID $NO BID $.52 

1" x 3/4" PVC s x s Reducer $.75 $.73 $1.04 $.74 $NO BID $2.50 

1" s x fip PVC Adapter $.45 $.45 $.90 $.44 $NO BID $.45 

1" s x mip PVC Adapter $.49 $.47 $.98 $.47 $NO BID $.48 

1" s x s PVC 90° Bend $1.01 $.55 $1.10 $.52 $NO BID $.50 

1" s x t PVC 90° Bend $1.01 $.70 $1.46 $.70 $NO BID $.64 
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Description 
Consolidated 
Pipe & 
Supply 

Core & 
Main LP 

Ferguson 
Enterprise 

Fortiline 
Waterworks 

Tulsa 
Winwater 
Company 

Utility 
Supply 

1" s x s PVC Coupling $.57 $.43 $.86 $.43 $NO BID $.42 

1" s x s PVC 45° Bend $.81 $.70 $1.68 $.81 $NO BID $.75 

1" Sch. 40 PVC Pipe $.45 $.50 $.30 PER 
FT $.28/LF $NO BID $.32 

1" PEX $1.56 $1.15 $175.23 $1.65/LF $NO BID $1.69 

4" x 1" Tapping Saddle $126.60 $93.65 $97.67 $91.42 $90.47 $97.50 

6" x 1" Tapping Saddle $149.11 $110.30 $115.03 $107.68 $106.57 $113.20 

8" x 1" Tapping Saddle $184.55 $136.47 $142.41 $133.26 $131.88 $140.00 

12" x 1" Tapping Saddle $267.57 $197.86 $206.53 $193.23 $191.22 $205.00 

12" x 2" Tapping Saddle $307.23                                                                                                                       $227.16 $237.18 $221.86 $219.56 $235.00 

8" x 2" Tapping Saddle $211.52 $156.40 $163.39 $152.74 $151.16 $159.55 

6" x 2" Tapping Saddle $187.31 $138.51 $144.55 $135.26 $133.86 $145.75 

4" x 2" Tapping Saddle $160.71 $118.85 $124.06 $116.05 $114.85 $121.23 

16" x 2" Tapping Saddle $458.93 $339.12 $616.60 $331.42 $327.97 $350.00 

24" x 2" Tapping Saddle $584.00 $431.61 $751.40 $421.73 $417.35 $451.00 
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Description 
Consolidated 
Pipe & 
Supply 

Core & 
Main LP 

Ferguson 
Enterprise 

Fortiline 
Waterworks 

Tulsa 
Winwater 
Company 

Utility 
Supply 

10" x 1 1/2" Tapping Saddle $251.09 $185.99 $193.75 $185.53 $179.44 $195.00 

2" pvc x 3/4" Tapping Saddle $28.54 $29.46 $23.49 $27.63 $27.35 $33.00 

2" cc x mip Corp Stop $321.51 $237.75 $233.77 $225.62 $223.28 $242.40 

2" fip x flange Curb Stop $395.57 $293.00 $270.01 $277.58 $274.70 $298.27 

2" fip x fip Curb Stop $348.47 $257.85 $262.14 $244.54 $242.00 $262.50 

2" pk x mip adapter $102.11 $75.60 $75.88 $71.65 $70.97 $76.99 

2" pk x fip adapter $106.72 $79.00 $79.36 $74.89 $74.12 $80.48 

2" pk x pk coupling $135.95 $100.60 $101.05 $95.40 $94.41 $102.50 

2" pk x pk 90° Bend $283.72 $210.00 $210.89 $199.10 $197.04 $213.90 

2" fip x fip 90° Bend $22.49 $85.15 $33.49 $NO BID $27.77 $130.00 

2" mip x fip Street 90° Bend $31.55 $92.65 $45.56 $NO BID $40.56 $140.00 

2" Brass Collar $18.61 $85.15 $28.81 $NO BID $23.92 $100.00 

2" x 6" Brass Nipple $23.14 $37.85 $35.84 $NO BID $29.76 $48.00 

2" x 12" Brass Nipple $45.60 $76.00 $70.62 $NO BID $58.64 $96.00 
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Description 
Consolidated 
Pipe & 
Supply 

Core & 
Main LP 

Ferguson 
Enterprise 

Fortiline 
Waterworks 

Tulsa 
Winwater 
Company 

Utility 
Supply 

2" Compression Coupling $135.95 $112.15 $101.05 $95.40 $94.41 $115.00 

3/4" x 7" Meter Riser (Resetter) $129.31 $95.75 $47.47 $90.74 $89.81 $97.50 

3/4" x 12" Meter Riser $135.52 $100.65 $102.82 $95.10 $94.12 $102.20 

3/4" x 18" Meter Riser $203.51 $119.10 $128.66 $153.80 $111.74 $153.00 

1" x 12" Meter Riser $293.42 $187.00 $203.05 $220.76 $175.58 $224.00 

1 1/2" Meter Setter $1,432.43 $940.00 $NO BID $951.40 $951.39 $957.28 

2" Meter Setter $1,509.13 $1,075.00 $NO BID $1,012.88 $1,002.34 $1,095.00 

1 1/4" pk x pk coupling $51.94 $38.50 $21.46 $36.45 $36.08 $40.00 

2" Meter Flange $81.54 $60.31 $105.00 $57.22 $NO BID $61.00 

1 1/2 x 3/4 Bushing $49.01 $36.31 $14.44 $49.13 $NO BID $4500 

2" CTS Insert $3.00 $2.45 $2.00 $3.01 $2.98 $2.90 

6"Valve box riser $122.04 $39.65 $63.82 $45.69 $46.88 $55.00 

1"CTS Insert $2.06 $.95 $1.49 $2.18 $2.17 $1.80 

4" C900 $5.54 $5.28 $5.03 
PER FT 

$5.41/LF $NO BID $5.75 
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Description 
Consolidated 
Pipe & 
Supply 

Core & 
Main LP 

Ferguson 
Enterprise 

Fortiline 
Waterworks 

Tulsa 
Winwater 
Company 

Utility 
Supply 

4" Sch40 $1.68 $2.40 $1.70 
PER FT $1.46/LF $NO BID $1.91 

6"x15" Clamp $221.80 $245.00 $193.32 $252.84 $NO BID $252.00 

5/8"x 2" Brass Bolt $NO BID $.70 $NO BID $NO BID $NO BID $12.50 

5/8"x 2 1/2" Brass Bolt $NO BID $.70 $NO BID $NO BID $NO BID $1.50 

3/4"x2" Brass Bolt $NO BID $1.50 $NO BID $NO BID $NO BID $15.00 

3/4"x2 1/2" Brass Bolt $NO BID $1.50 $NO BID $NO BID $NO BID $16.50 

Wire connector $7.18 $1.95 $3.05 $NO BID $NO BID $4.45 

2" Brass 90° $22.49 $87.00 $33.42 $NO BID $NO BID $130.00 

8x4 SST $902.80 $395.00 $458.69 $NO BID $NO BID $555.00 

12" C900 Pipe $41.20 $39.24 $36.28 
PER FT $40.26/LF $NO BID $41.00 

6" CD14 C900 Pipe $11.11 $10.58 $12.49 
PER FT $10.86/LF $NO BID $11.10 

6" DI Pipe $28.59 $45.15 $29.85 $NO BID $NO BID $28.00 

3" DI Pipe $75.90 $67.75 $106.81 $NO BID $NO BID $69.00 

VALVE, GATE 4" R.W.G.V. FLANGE X MJ, 
ANSI/AWWA C509/C515, NRS, O.L. W/ 2" OP NUT & MJ 
ACCESSORIES 

$700.31 $658.00 $644.47 $702.06 $662.68 $715.00 
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Description 
Consolidated 
Pipe & 
Supply 

Core & 
Main LP 

Ferguson 
Enterprise 

Fortiline 
Waterworks 

Tulsa 
Winwater 
Company 

Utility 
Supply 

VALVE, GATE 4" R.W.G.V. MJ X MJ, ANSI/AWWA 
C509/C515, NRS, O.L. W/ 2" OP NUT & MJ 
ACCESSORIES 

$735.59 $690.00 $676.93 $737.43 $747.57 $745.00 

VALVE, GATE 6" R.W.G.V. FLANGE X MJ, ANSI/AWWA 
C509/C515, NRS, O.L. W/ 2" OP NUT & MJ 
ACCESSORIES 

$919.04 $877.00 $845.67 $921.34 $898.52 $918.00 

VALVE, GATE 6" R.W.G.V. MJ X MJ, ANSI/AWWA 
C509/C515, NRS, O.L. W/ 2" OP NUT & MJ 
ACCESSORIES 

$952.56 $875.00 $876.27 $954.94 $980.58 $950.00 

VALVE, GATE 8" R.W.G.V. FLANGE X MJ, 
ANSI/AWWA C509/C515, NRS, O.L. W/ 2" OP NUT & MJ 
ACCESSORIES 

$1,431.78 $1,338.00 $1,317.26 $1,435.36 $1,372.82 $1,435.00 

VALVE, GATE 1 O" R.W.G.V. FLANGE X MJ, 
ANSI/AWWA C509/C515, NRS, O.L. W/ 2" OP 
NUT & MJ ACCESSORIES 

$2,252.63 $2,110.00 $2,016.74 $2,258.27 $2,255.63 $1,480.00 

VALVE, GATE 1 O" R.W.G.V. MJ X MJ, ANSI/AWWA 
C509/C515, NRS, O.L. W/ 2" OP NUT & MJ 
ACCESSORIES 

$2,303.20 $2,115.00 $2,118.52 $2,308.96 $2,281.01 $2,299.00 

VALVE, GATE 12" R.W.G.V. FLANGE X MJ, 
ANSI/AWWA C509/C515, NRS, O.L. W/ 2" OP NUT & MJ 
ACCESSORIES 
 

$2,785.94 $2,530.00 $2,562.55 $2,792.63 $2,719.82 $2,790.00 

VALVE, GATE 12" R.W.G.V. MJ X MJ, ANSI/AWWA 
C509/C515, NRS, O.L. W/ 2" OP NUT & MJ 
ACCESSORIES 

$2,911.19 $2,640.00 $2,677.69 $2,918.48 $2,894.17 $2,859.00 

CLAMP, 4" X 7.5" QCRD-07-0561-001EX-HDW 
4.74-5.61 CI/DI/C900 $110.85 $130.00 $61.20 $130.02 $110.95 $130.00 

CLAMP 4" x 15" QCRD-15-0513-001EX-HDW 
4.74-5.61 CI/DI/C900 

$192.54 $225.00 $93.39 $225.02 $220.64 $224.99 

CLAMP 6" X 15" QGRD-15-0765-001EX-HDW 
6.84-7.65 C900/DI/CI 

$221.80 $252.00 $193.32 $252.84 $257.42 $251.99 

CLAMP 6" X 15" QCRD-15-0765-001EX-HDW 
6.84-7.65 C900/DI/CI 

$221.80 $252.00 $193.32 $252.84 $257.42 $251.99 
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Consolidated 
Pipe & 
Supply 

Core & 
Main LP 

Ferguson 
Enterprise 

Fortiline 
Waterworks 

Tulsa 
Winwater 
Company 

Utility 
Supply 

CLAMP 6" X 7-1/2" QCRD-07-0765-001EX-HDW 6.84-
7.65 C900/DI/CI $128.08 $147.45 $97.59 $145.93 $128.71 $145.60 

CLAMP, 6" X 30" QCRD-30-0765-001EX-HDW6.84-7.65 
CI/DI/C900 $565.91 $650.00 $367.30 $643.73 $513.29 $642.00 

CLAMP, 8" X 7-1/2" QCRD-07-0984-001EX-HDW 8.98-
9.84 CI/DI/C900 $142.21 $157.00 $162.16 $157.55 $145.57 $157.50 

BOLTED COUPLING 4" 421 TOP BOLT CPLG  
4.46-5.60 $197.82 $238.00 $1,779.33 $198.31 $215.23 $198.00 

BOLTED COUPLING 6" 421 TOP BOLT CPLG  
6.56-7.60 $261.19 $301.50 $236.78 $261.18 $284.04 $260.00 

BOLTED COUPLING 8" 421 TOP BOLT CPLG  
8.54-9.85 $295.79 $345.40 $268.15 $296.53 $321.65 $295.00 

BOLTED COUPLING 12" 421 TOP BOLT CPLG 
12.62X 13.10-14.40 $547.34 $595.00 $416.92 $461.04 $585.68 $460.00 

HYDRANT, 2' FIRE 4.5 V.O. A-421 $2,499.21 $2,375.00 $2,378.35 $2,404.94 $2,386.26 $2,640.00 

HYDRANT, 3-1/2' FIRE 4.5 V.O. $2,598.12 $2,495.00 $2,525.22 $2,550.92 $2,527.86 $2,685.00 

HYDRANT, 4-1/2' FIRE 4.5 V.O. A-421 $2,697.66 $2,610.00 $2,621.69 $2,599.79 $2,627.82 $2,795.00 

1' HYDRANT EXTENSION (East Jordan) $519.18 $390.00 $NO BID $390.78 $378.83 $540.00 

1' HYDRANT EXTENSION (Mueller Improved) $599.76 $495.00 $439.80 $NO BID $NO BID $620.00 

1' HYDRANT EXTENSION (Clow) $461.16 $795.00 $NO BID $549.10 $627.43 $480.00 

1' HYDRANT EXTENSION (American Darling) $329.62 $565.00 $NO BID $NO BID $NO BID $320.00 
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2' HYDRANT EXTENSION (East Jordan) $665.55 $495.00 $NO BID $497.36 $482.15 $704.00 

2' HYDRANT EXTENSION (Mueller Improved) $755.06 $525.00 $576.53 $NO BID $NO BID $820.00 

2' HYDRANT EXTENSION (Clow) $589.37 $995.00 $NO BID $647.24 $532.29 $622.00 

2' HYDRANT EXTENSION (American Darling) $423.36 $995.00 $NO BID $NO BID $NO BID $418.00 

3/4" PRSXPRS PEX CPLG NO LEAD $NO BID $4.60 $6.18 $3.88 $NO BID $4.65 

1"X3/4" PEX PRS RED CPLG NL $NO BID $7.17 $9.31 $6.35 $NO BID $7.00 

1" PRSXPRS PEX CPLG NO LEAD $NO BID $10.00 $12.99 $7.07 $NO BID $9.50 

3/4" PLASTIC PEX PRS TEST PLUG $NO BID $1.35 $1.62 $1.10 $NO BID $1.35 

1" PLASTIC PEX PRS TEST PLUG $NO BID $2.10 $2.48 $1.69 $NO BID $1.80 

3/4" PRSXFLR PEX ADPT NO LEAD $NO BID $10.65 $15.47 $10.46 $NO BID $9.25 

1" PRSXFLR PEX ADPT NO LEAD $NO BID $15.55 $19.77 $13.00 $NO BID $14.00 

1"X1-1/4" PEX PRESSX FIP UBSP 2893ZL $NO BID $15.55 $30.26 $13.83 $NO BID $18.00 

3/4" PRSXPRS PEX 90 NO LEAD $NO BID $7.10 $8.97 $6.12 $NO BID $6.55 

1" PRSXPRS PEX 90 NO LEAD $NO BID $17.00 $21.61 $11.41 $NO BID $16.00 
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3/4" PRSXM PT PEX ADPT NO LEAD $NO BID $4.45 $5.69 $3.84 $NO BID $4.25 

3/4"X1" PRSXMPT PEX ADPT NL $NO BID $10.05 $12.77 $8.35 $NO BID $12.00 

1"X3/4" PEX PRESS X MIP $NO BID $10.65 $11.63 
VIEGA $9.57 $NO BID $9.25 

1" PRSXMPT PEXADPT NO LEAD $NO BID $7.65 $9.77 $6.90 $NO BID $7.95 

VIEGA PUREFLOW PRESS TAILPIECE 
PEX3/4"X1" 96140 

$NO BID $12.70 $17.60 $11.00 $NO BID $19.50 
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