
Item

Fleet Distributors 

Express

Fleet Safety 

Equipment

Metro Emergency 

Outfitters 911 Custom

Specification

Police Vehicle Equipment w/option to 

install

Equipment only No bid 140,399.26 139,332.00 131,975.24

Options:

Install only

Full profile outfitting           qty. 12 22,440.00 No bid 21,600.00 No bid

Additional delivery cost     qty 12  0.00 1,200.00

Supply & install equipment

Full profile outfitting           qty. 12 No bid No Bid 160,932.00 167,975.24

Additional delivery cost     qty 12 2,350.00 12,000.00

Total for Equipment No bid 140,399.26 139,332.00 131,975.24

Optional total for installation 22,440.00 No bid 22,800.00 No bid

Optional total for equiopment and installation No bid No bid 163,282.00 179,975.24

Meet Specs. Y Y Y Y

Delivery 36 days 56 days 45 days 60 days

Warranty

Service life of 

vehicle

Service life of 

vehicle Limited lifetime

Bid pricing good for: 30 days 120 days 45 days 120 days

Bids were sent to 12 vendors Local 

installation.   

Tulsa County 

Sheriff 

Police Vehicle Equipment w/option to install
Bid# 16.104    

Bid opening 11-04-15

Per Karla Scott  

they made a 

mistake on 

pricing the 

stalker radar 

sytem originally 

the total was 

$131,086.96 

with the 

corrected price 

as $140,399.26

Vendor is 

located in OKC.


